

LANDRY, MAZZEO, DEMBINSKI & STEVENS, P.C.
37000 GRAND RIVER AVENUE
SUITE 200
FARMINGTON HILLS, MI 48335-2882
(248) 476-6900
Tax ID#: 26-2709897

To: Saline Township
 Attention: Kelly Marion , Township Clerk
 4254 Arkona Rd
 Saline, MI 48176

Bill: DAVID B LANDRY
Invoice Date: January 22, 2026
Invoice No: 31801

Client/Matter: DID.28202
Description: RD Michigan Property LLC v Saline Township
Email: Salinetownship@gmail.com

For professional services rendered through January 22, 2026

Date	Service Description	Hours
Fees:		
11-20-2025 DBL	RECEIPT AND REVIEW PROPOSED JOINT STIPULATION REGARDING BRIEFING AND HEARING FOR MOTION TO INTERVENE TO SET ASIDE CONSENT JUDGMENT	.20
12-16-2025 DBL	VIEW VIDEO OF OCTOBER 1, 2025 TOWNSHIP BOARD MEETING	.50
12-17-2025 DBL	REVIEW MOTION OF KATHRYN HAUSHALTER TO INTERVENE TO INVALIDATE THE APPROVAL OF THE CONSENT JUDGMENT AND BRIEF IN SUPPORT	1.00
12-17-2025 DBL	REVIEW PROPOSED ANSWER OF PROPOSED INTERVENOR TO PLAINTIFF'S COMPLAINT AND PROPOSED CROSS CLAIM OF INTERVENOR TO INVALIDATE APPROVAL OF CONSENT JUDGMENT	1.00
12-17-2025 DBL	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWNSHIP ATTY FRED LUCAS RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	.20
12-17-2025 DBL	REVIEW OPEN MEETINGS ACT AND LEGAL RESEARCH RE REENACTMENT OF A	.50

Date	Service Description	Hours
	MEETING CURING ANY PROCEDURAL ERROR IN MEETING MINUTES	
12-17-2025 DBL	COMMUNICATION WITH FRED LUCAS TWP ATTY TO DISCUSS [REDACTED]	.60
12-17-2025 DBL	REVIEW APPEAL FILED IN ZBA	.40
12-18-2025 DBL	RECEIPT AND REVIEW MOTION FOR ADMISSION TO PRACTICE LAW IN MICHIGAN PRO HAC VICE BY ATTY ROBERT DUBE, BRIEF IN SUPPORT AND AFFIDAVIT	.30
12-18-2025 DBL	COMMUNICATION FROM ATTY FOR INTERVENORS RE HEARING DATE FOR MOTION TO INTERVENE	.20
12-19-2025 DBL	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TWP CLERK KELLY MARION RE [REDACTED]	.20
12-19-2025 DBL	RECEIPT AND REVIEW APPEAL TO ZBA BY KATHRYN HAUSALTER	1.20
12-22-2025 DBL	ZOOM CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEYS FRED LUCAS AND ALAN GREENE TO DISCUSS [REDACTED]	1.30
12-22-2025 DBL	RECEIPT AND REVIEW LETTER FROM RD DEVELOPMENT TO ATTY ELLIS BOAL AND PARALEGAL LUANNE KOZMA RE THEIR ZBA APPEAL	.20
12-29-2025 DBL	REVIEW OF PLAINTIFF RD MANAGER PROPERTY'S PROPOSED RESPONSE BRIEF TO MOTION TO INTERVENE AND CHALLENGE THE CONSENT JUDGMENT	1.30
12-29-2025 DBL	MICROSOFT TEAMS CONFERENCE WITH PLAINTIFF ATTY RE [REDACTED]	.40
12-30-2025 DBL	COMMUNICATION WITH ATTY FOR PROPOSED INTERVENORS AD DISCUSSION RE THEIR POTENTIAL MOTION FOR EXPEDITED HEARING ON THEIR MOTION TO INTERVENE	.20
12-31-2025 DBL	RECEIPT AND REVIEW INTERVENOR'S PROPOSED MOTION AND BRIEF TO EXPEDITE HEARING ON MOTION TO	.50

Date	Service Description	Hours
	INTERVENE TO SET ASIDE CONSENT JUDGMENT	
01-02-2026 DBL	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TWP ATTY FRED LUCAS [REDACTED]	■
01-02-2026 DBL	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTY FOR RD MICHIGAN PROPERTY RE INTERVENOR'S MOTION FOR EXPEDITED HEARING AND OUR RESPONSE	.20
01-02-2026 DBL	RECEIPT AND REVIEW PROPOSED JOINT MOTION	.40
01-02-2026 DBL	CONFERENCE CALL AMONG ALL ATTORNEYS RE SUBMITTING A JOINT MOTION FOR EXPEDITED HEARING ON THE MOTION TO INTERVENE AND AGREEMENT AMONG ALL ATTORNEYS ON THE LANGUAGE OF THAT MOTION AND PROPOSED POINT ORDER SETTING AN EXPEDITED HEARING DATE	.40
01-03-2026 DBL	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF E-MAIL TO TOWNSHIP RE [REDACTED]	.40
01-07-2026 DBL	RECEIPT AND REVIEW SIGNED ORDER OF THE COURT SETTING DUE DATES FOR BRIEFS AND ORAL ARGUMENT ON MOTION TO INTERVENE	.20
01-08-2026 DBL	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE AEURBACH OF CARLISLE WORTMANN [REDACTED]	■
01-10-2026 DBL	REVIEW IN DETAIL ZBA APPEAL BY KATHRYN HAUSHALTER AND LEGAL RESEARCH RE ZONING MAP CHANGES	1.40
01-12-2026 DBL	LEGAL RESEARCH RE JURISDICTION OF ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS AFTER CONSENT JUDGMENT ENTERED	1.80
01-12-2026 DBL	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTY FRED LUCAS RE [REDACTED]	.20

Date	Service Description	Hours
01-12-2026 DBL	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTY FOR RD MANAGER PROPERTY RE [REDACTED]	■
01-14-2026 DBL	DRAFTING LETTER TO KATHRYN HAUSHALTER AND OTHER APPLICANT TO THE ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS INFORMING THEM THAT THE ZBA DOES NOT HAVE JURISDICTION TO HEAR THEIR APPEAL	1.60
01-15-2026 DBL	E-MAIL FROM LUANNE KOZMA DISAGREEING WITH OUR LETTER DENYING ZBA APPLICATION FOR LACK OF JURISDICTION	.20
01-16-2026 DBL	CONFERENCE CALL WITH ATTY FRED LUCAS AND ATTY FOR RD DEVELOPMENT RE [REDACTED]	.80
01-20-2026 DBL	LEGAL RESEARCH RE RIGHT OF REFERENDUM NOT APPLICABLE TO CONSENT JUDGMENT	.60
01-20-2026 DBL	COMMUNICATION WITH ATTY FRED LUCAS RE [REDACTED]	.20
01-20-2026 DBL	CONFERENCE WITH ATTY FOR RD MICHIGAN PROPERTY RE [REDACTED]	■
01-21-2026 DBL	ATTORNEY CLIENT PRIVILEGED CONFERENCE [REDACTED]	1.80
01-21-2026 DBL	DRAFTING PROPOSED NOTICE FOR SPECIAL MEETING AND POTENTIAL MOTION FOR CONSIDERATION OF THE TOWNSHIP BOARD	.30
01-21-2026 DBL	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTY FOR RELATED DEVELOPMENT RE [REDACTED]	■

Total Fees 21.80 \$ 6,540.00

Amount Due This Matter \$ 6,540.00

Allocation of Fees:

	Rate	Hours	Fee
DBL...LANDRY DAVID B	\$ 300.00	21.80	\$ 6,540.00
		21.80	\$ 6,540.00

PLEASE MAKE CHECK PAYABLE TO: LANDRY, MAZZEO, DEMBINSKI & STEVENS, P.C.